	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	List Price
	Percentage Discount
	Final Price

	Example
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 
	 $300,000.00 
	15%
	       255,000.00 

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	Pricing for base model truck only:

	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	
	

	25’ (+/- 5 feet) Mid Mounted Aerial Apparatus, 4 Door 
	
	
	 $NO BID   

	50’ (+/- 5 feet) Mid Mounted Aerial Apparatus, 4 Door
	
	
	 $NO BID

	75’ (+/- 5 feet) Mid Mounted Aerial Apparatus, 4 Door
	
	
	 $NO BID   

	
	$964,423.00
	15%
	 $819,760.00  

	125’ (+/- 5 feet) Mid Mounted Aerial Apparatus, 4 Door 
	
	
	 $NO BID  

	25’ (+/- 5 feet) Rear Mounted Aerial Apparatus, 4 Door 
	
	
	 $NO BID

	50’ (+/- 5 feet) Rear Mounted Aerial Apparatus, 4 Door 
	
	
	 $NO BID

	75’ (+/- 5 feet) Rear Mounted Aerial Apparatus, 4 Door     
	$660,848.00
	15%
	 $561,721.00   

	100’ (+/- 5 feet) Rear Mounted Aerial Apparatus, 4 Door
	$793,610.00
	15%
	 $674,569.00   

	125’ (+/- 5 feet) Rear Mounted Aerial Apparatus, 4 Door   
	$1,153,730.
	15%
	 $980,671.00

	Medium Duty Rescue Apparatus, 2 Door 
	
	
	$192,647.00
	15%
	 $163,750.00  

	Medium Duty Rescue Apparatus, 4 Door 
	
	
	$230,260.00
	15%
	 $172,771.00   

	Min. 2000 Gallon Water Tender, 2 Door
	
	
	$254,069.00
	15%
	 $215,958.00  

	Wildland Fire Apparatus Type 3, 2 Door
	
	
	
	
	 $NO BID  

	Wildland Fire Apparatus Type 3, 4 Door
	
	
	
	
	 $NO BID 

	Wildland Fire Apparatus Type 6, 2 Door
	
	
	
	
	 $NO BID

	Wildland Fire Apparatus Type 6, 4 Door
	
	
	
	
	 $NO BID   

	Commercial Pumper 2 Door
	
	
	
	$240,151.00
	15%
	 $204,128.00   

	Commercial Pumper 4 Door
	
	
	
	$251,427.00
	15%
	 $213,713.00

	ARFF Class 3 
	
	
	
	
	
	$338,586.00
	0%
	 $338,586.00   
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